
From: Judson, Edward
To: Sims, April
Subject: FW: Noncompliance for 2500020 - Dollar General Store 10756
Date: Tuesday, July 2, 2024 3:18:39 PM
Attachments: Dollar General Remaining Balance Invoice (2).pdf

 
 
From: AW Green Mangement <awgreen1410@sbcglobal.net> 
Sent: Tuesday, July 2, 2024 3:13 PM
To: Decastro, Sandra <SDECASTR@idem.IN.gov>; Young, Kali S <KSYoung@idem.IN.gov>; Judson,
Edward <ejudson@idem.IN.gov>; AW Green Mangement <awgreen1410@sbcglobal.net>
Subject: Re: Noncompliance for 2500020 - Dollar General Store 10756

 
**** This is an EXTERNAL email. Exercise caution. DO NOT open attachments or
click links from unknown senders or unexpected email. ****

Hello, 
 
We have finished repairs to the Dollar General 690 Michigan St LaPaz, IN
please see attached. 
 
Thank you!
 
Eva Romo
Mer-Car DG Corp. 
(312)226-8690
 
On Wednesday, May 8, 2024 at 12:29:36 PM CDT, AW Green Mangement
<awgreen1410@sbcglobal.net> wrote:
 
 
 
 
 
 
We are looking into this and will give you a response soon. 
 
Thank you!
 
Eva Romo
Mer-Car DG Corp.
(312)226-8690
 

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone
 
On Wednesday, May 8, 2024, 11:48 AM, Decastro, Sandra <SDECASTR@idem.IN.gov>
wrote:
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Collins Crew Home Repair &
 Maintenance LLC Invoice


Jarrod Collins DATE


Bill To:


Comments:


Description: Amount


Remaining Balance


THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS!


July 1, 2024


Customer Name: Dollar General Marshall County / Eva Romo


Street Address: 690 Michigan St.


City, ST, Zip Code: LaPaz, IN 46537


Phone / Email: 312.226.8690


Fix bathrooms, fix ceiling (estimated 75 tiles), repair roof of water leaks (if any, if none
inspect sprinklers for leaks/sweat), redirect/bury downspouts, french drain (3x), grade
earth away from building, and cover/level with rock (estimated 15 tons)


Labor $25,000.00


Materials (estimated; subject to change) $12,000.00


Material and 1/2 Labor cost received $24,500.00


$12,500.00


All Estimates are for LABOR only unless otherwise marked.
 Disposal fees and materials cost may also be applied.


  If you have any questions concerning this estimate, please contact Jarrod Collins.
 Estimates valid for 30 days.


 Accepted Payments: Cash, Check, Zelle, Venmo, Square - will incur additional processing fee


Customer Signature:


Date:


Phone: (574) 222 - 7378          E-mail: cchomerepair6@gmail.com







Good afternoon Ms. Ava Romo,

 

Per our phone conversation this afternoon, I left a message
with Mr. Merv Duckatt on March 14, 2024, but received no
response.

 

The attached SBIS is the information we have on file for Dollar
General, located in Lapaz, IN.  Please review it; make
revisions where necessary; and email it back to me so we may
update our database.

 

Also attached are the letters mailed to Mr. Duckatt. Please
review the letters, and submit your response to IDEM by
Wednesday, May 15, 2024:

1. A response to address the Significant Deficiencies found
during an onsite- inspection on January 3, 2023;

2. A corrective action plan (CAP) to indicate the Significant
Deficiencies have been corrected.

 

Failure to submit the required reports may result in a referral to
IDEM’s Enforcement. A referral may include civil penalties.

If you have any questions pertaining to the required reports,
please contact Edward Judson at 317-234-7456 or Kali Young
at 574-229-7502.

Edward and/or Kali will provide me updates regarding your
response.

 

 

Thank you,



 

Sandra DeCastro 
Senior Environmental Manager

Indiana Dept. of Env. Mgt. (IDEM)

Drinking Water Branch / Compliance Section

email: sdecastr@idem.in.gov

tel# - 317/234-7444
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